
 
 

STAFF REPORT FOR CALENDAR ITEM NO.:  10.2 
FOR THE MEETING OF:  April12, 2018 
 

TRANSBAY JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY 
 
BRIEF DESCRIPTION:  
Authorize the Executive Director to execute a purchase agreement and software license 
agreement with eLock Technologies in an amount not to exceed $376,738 for manufacture, 
delivery, and installation of secure electronic long-term bicycle lockers and associated software 
for the Salesforce Transit Center.  
 
REPORT: 
In preparation for the opening of the Salesforce Transit Center, staff expects certain demand 
from transit riders, the public, and other facility users for bicycle storage.  
 
Based on the mixed planned uses of the transit center for public facility, retail, services, 
administrative office, and entertainment uses, San Francisco Planning Code section 155.2 calls 
for 100 Class 1 bicycle parking spaces at the transit center building site.  The City Planning Code 
explains that Class 1 spaces must “protect the entire bicycle, its components and accessories 
against theft and inclement weather, including wind-driven rain.” The City Planning Code finds 
that “acceptable forms of Class 1 spaces include (A) Individual Lockers, (B) Attended Facilities, 
(C) Monitored Parking, (D) Restricted Access Parking, and (E) Stacked Parking”.  Class 2 
spaces are, on the other hand, “spaces located in a publicly-accessible, highly visible location 
intended for transient or short-term use by visitors, guests, and patrons to the building…”.  Under 
the City Planning Code, the transit center should have 130 Class 2 bicycle parking spaces.     
 
TJPA staff have reviewed the Federal Transit Administration (FTA) Manual on Pedestrian and 
Bicycle Connections to Transit.  The FTA best practices outlined in the manual align with the 
San Francisco Planning Code requirements as well as with best practices and bicycle plans 
adopted by regional and local transit entities such as BART, SFMTA and Caltrain.   
 
TJPA staff have identified the west end of the transit center site south of Natoma Street as a 
suitable location for the Class 1 bike facilities. Staff has coordinated and validated the layout of 
long term bicycle storage with planning, design, construction, future operations, and transit 
stakeholder requirements of the Transbay Program. The TJPA Program team have also 
coordinated with Motivate to plan for a future Ford GoBike station in close proximity to the 
Class 1 bike facilities.  Bicycle racks for Class 2 spaces will be located at various sites around 
the building, as shown below.   
 



 
 

 
 
For long term bicycle storage, a self-attended and secure electronic bicycle locker provides an 
optimal solution.  Staff have researched bike facilities recommended by various local, state, and 
federal stakeholders and agencies.  BART, SFMTA, City of Oakland, City of El Cerrito, Capital 
Corridor and PCJPB (Caltrain) currently use and recommend eLock Technologies for long term 
bicycle parking.  Having one type of bicycle locker at the transit center is preferable to owning a 
variety of lockers, to keep licensing and maintenance costs lower.   
 
eLock Technologies manufactures and provides annual software licensing (BikeLink®) for self-
attended, electronic shared use, secure, long-term bicycle storage lockers.  The electronic lockers 
supplied and maintained by eLock Technologies are durable, secure, and well-liked by users.  
There are compelling reasons for TJPA to procure this equipment from eLock Technologies: 
standardization product/operating system; consistent customer experience; no other equal/better 
product; and, locally built/maintained.  eLock Technologies is a Bay Area company based in 
Berkeley.  Product development, assembly and maintenance are all supplied by local staff and 
ownership.  This type of Class 1 storage is preferable to other types of Class 1 storage identified 
in the City Planning Code primarily due to self-attendance, public accessibility, shared access 
and electronic monitoring. 
 
Further, eLock Technologies provides a shared electronic lock technology through BikeLink®.  
The regional transit stakeholders that will be making connections at the transit center as well as 
national transit hub locations offer compatible shared access for the BikeLink® software.  
Benefits of BikeLink® include the following: operational flexibility, ease of use, interoperability, 
and low operating cost. 
 
TJPA requested that eLock Technologies provide best pricing consistent with other local 
procurements such as SFMTA and BART.  eLock Technologies provided a cost proposal for 100 
bicycle parking spaces (25 Quad lockers) on December 1, 2017.  TJPA staff have analyzed the 
pricing/terms; the initial capital cost of procurement totals $376,738 including manufacturing, 
delivery, and installation.  The procurement timeline is roughly 8-12 calendar weeks from time 
of deposit to delivery/installation. 
 



 
 

TJPA staff have negotiated the attached form of quote, purchase agreement, with associated 
product warranty, and software license agreement, and acknowledge BikeLink®’s standard form 
of user agreement with customers. A separate service/operations agreement will be executed 
between TJPA’s asset manager, Lincoln, and eLock Technologies for servicing of the facilities; 
the cost of that agreement includes 5 years of software license renewal. 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Authorize the Executive Director to execute a purchase agreement and software license 
agreement with eLock Technologies in an amount not to exceed $376,738 for manufacture, 
delivery, and installation of electronic bicycle lockers and associated software for the Salesforce 
Transit Center.  
 
ENCLOSURES: 

1. Resolution 
2. Quote 

Purchase Agreement 
Product Warranty 
Software License Agreement 
User Agreement 

 
 
  



 
 

TRANSBAY JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY 
BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

 
Resolution No. _____________ 

 
WHEREAS, The Transbay Joint Powers Authority (TJPA) is a joint powers agency 

organized and existing under the laws of the State of California; and 
 

WHEREAS, Pursuant to the Joint Powers Agreement creating the TJPA, dated April 4, 
2001, the TJPA has the authority to, among other things, make and enter into contracts and 
exercise all powers necessary and proper to carry out the provisions of the Joint Powers 
Agreement; and 
 

WHEREAS, The TJPA expects certain demand from transit riders, the public, and other 
facility users for bicycle storage at the new transit center; and 

 
WHEREAS, Based on he planned mix of uses at the transit center, the San Francisco 

Planning Code Section 155.2 recommends that the TJPA install 100 Class 1 bicycle storage 
spaces at the new transit center. This recommendation is consistent with Federal Transit 
Administration best practice guidelines as well as practices and plans of regional and local transit 
entities; and 

 
WHEREAS, The TJPA requires the services of an entity to manufacture, deliver, and 

install Class 1 bicycle storage at the new transit center; and 
 
WHEREAS, TJPA staff has coordinated and validated the layout of long term bicycle 

storage with planning, design, construction, future operations, and transit stakeholder 
requirements of the Transbay Program; and  

 
WHEREAS, TJPA staff has received a proposal from a local small business, eLock 

Technologies, and has negotiated with eLock Technologies the terms and conditions of the 
attached quote, purchase agreement and associated product warranty, software license 
agreement, and standard form of user agreement; and 

 
WHEREAS, There are compelling reasons for TJPA to procure this equipment from 

eLock Technologies; and 
 
WHEREAS, TJPA staff has confirmed pricing for this procurement is commensurate 

with similar purchases by other local public agencies; now, therefore, be it 
 

RESOLVED, That the TJPA Board of Directors authorizes the Executive Director to 
execute a purchase agreement and software license agreement with eLock Technologies in 
substantially the form attached for an amount not to exceed $376,738 for manufacture, delivery, 
and installation of electronic bicycle lockers and associated software for the new transit center. 

 
I hereby certify that the foregoing resolution was adopted by the Transbay Joint Powers 
Authority Board of Directors at its meeting of April 12, 2018. 

 
____________________________________ 
Secretary, Transbay Joint Powers Authority 
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